Agenda Item VI.10

From: Joel Bouvier

To: Bristol Town Administrator

Subject: Re: Bouvier water connection application
Date: Thursday, October 24, 2024 5:35:39 PM

Valerie lot 2 had a old barn for animals and they had a water line tie into the
intersection of Pine street and Liberty street on the old water line until last October
2023. Munson didn’t put in a new curb stop for the old barn as the animals are gone
now. What I’'m asking for is a discount on that tap on fee/curb stop,as the previous
owners would have paid for it years ago. | have put in a new curb stop on lot 2 with
3/4” k copper off a 2” copper pipe on our way going to the back lots. I'm not asking for
the money of the new curb stop material at $424.58

I’'m just asking for one lot not to be bill as the Previous owners would have paid for
this tap on fee year’s ago

Thanks Joel

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPad

On Thursday, October 24, 2024, 2:33 PM, Bristol Town Administrator
<townadmin@bristolvt.org> wrote:

Hi Joel,

| am not understanding your request about a $500 credit for an existing
connection. The plans are calling for four new residential connections.

--Valerie

Valerie Capels, Town Administrator
& Emergency Management Director
Town of Bristol

1 South Street

P.O. Box 249

Bristol, VT 05443

P: (802) 453-2410 Ext. 1

F: (802) 453-5188

E: townadmin@bristolvt.org

W: www.bristolvt.org

FB: https://www.facebook.com/bristolvt/

IG: https://www.instagram.com/townofbristolvt/

Please note this email message, along with any response or reply, may be
considered a public record subject to disclosure under the Vermont Public
Records Law (1 V.S.A. §§ 315-320).

From: Joel Bouvier <joelbouvier@yahoo.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 24, 2024 8:20 AM
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To: Bristol Town Administrator <townadmin@bristolvt.org>
Subject: Fw: Bouvier water connection application

Valerie can you put me on the agenda to talk about this water connection
fee

Thanks Joel
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPad

Begin forwarded message:

On Wednesday, October 23, 2024, 9:13 AM, Joel Bouvier
<joelbouvier@yahoo.com> wrote:

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

On Wednesday, October 23, 2024, 9:12 AM, Bristol Clerk
<clerk@bristolvt.org> wrote:
Hi Joel

Here is the Invoice.
Thanks.

Sharon Lucia

Town Clerk/Treasurer
Town of Bristol

PO Box 249

Bristol, VT 05443
802.453.2410 x5
clerk@bristolvt.or

www.bristolvt.org

NOTE: Our office hours are Monday — Thursday
- 8 am to 4:30 pm. The office is CLOSED on
Fridays. Appointments are still required for
research in the Land Records.

Please note that this email message, along with any response
or reply, is considered a public record, and thus, subject to
disclosure under the Vermont Public Records Law (1 V.S.A. §§
315-320).

From: Joel Bouvier <joelbouvier@yahoo.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 8:45 AM
To: Bristol Town Administrator
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<townadmin@pbristolvt.org>; Bristol Clerk

<clerk@bristolvt.org>; Christopher Lapierre
<clapierre@nbmvt.com>

Subject: Re: Bouvier water connection application

Valerie can you or Shanon send me a invoice for
that on the town stationery, so | can forward it to the
banks loan officer and he will transfer the funds to
the towns account as we did for the water line
material

Thanks Joel

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Tuesday, October 22, 2024, 1:15 PM, Bristol Town
Administrator <townadmin@bristolvt.org> wrote:
Hi Joel,

It appears we have not received the
$1,500 balance for your water
connection application. Is there an
update on the status of the state
wastewater permit approval?

Thanks,
--Valerie

Valerie Capels, Town Administrator
& Emergency Management Director
Town of Bristol

1 South Street

P.O. Box 249

Bristol, VT 05443

P: (802) 453-2410 Ext. 1

F: (802) 453-5188

E: townadmin@bristolvt.org

W: www.bristolvt.org

FB: https://www.facebook.com/bristolvt/

IG: https://www.instagram.com/townofbri
stolvt/

Please note this email message, along
with any response or reply, may be
considered a public record subject to
disclosure under the Vermont Public
Records Law (1 V.S.A. §§ 315-320).
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From: Joel Bouvier

<joelbouvier@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, October 14, 2024 3:20 PM

To: Bristol Town Administrator
<townadmin@bristolvt.org>; Jill Marsano

<jil@vtums.com>
Subject:

Valerie and Jill here is the copy of

my water district application that | filled
out and drop off when | paid for my
water tap on fee on July 30

Joel
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPad
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